
Amburgey, Tom 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

Jose Cardoso <jcardoso@awared igital.com > 
Thursday, September 26, 2013 3:43 PM 
LaMott, Ted 

Cc: Amburgey, Tom; Matt Tickle; Josh Mann 
Subject: RE: RFP #FY 2006-2007-004 SERVICE AND MAINTENANCE OF VIDEO EQUPMENT 

Ted, 

Aware Digital will continue to honor the price model base of 8% for the support (maintenance) agreement as stipulated 
in the original RFP/contract. The invoice to the City will be calculated at 8% on the invoiced value for the work we 
completed per project after the first year warranty period has expired. For example, the original RFP did not include the 
marina, Sunrise or Sunset parks, or the municipal access control system. The cost of these individual projects will be 
added to the cost of the original RFP. I can have the calculations prepa red for you next week. 

I look forward to continue to work with your team, 

Jose . 

Jose M. Cardoso 
Director of Operations 
Aware Digital Inc. 
(305) 373-0047 ext. 721 Office 
(786) 972-1190 Cell 
3991 Commerce Parkway 
Miramar, Florida 33025 
J cardoso@awared igital.com 

From: LaMott, Ted [mailto:Tlamott@hallandalebeachfl .gov] 
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2013 1:27 PM 
To: Jose Cardoso 
Cc: Amburgey, Tom 
Subject: FW: RFP # FY 2006-2007-004 SERVICE AND MAINTENANCE OF VIDEO EQUPMENT 

Please see #2 below. 

Can I get something in writing to cover it? 

'I'etf La:Mott 
Director of Information Technology 
City of Hallandale Beach 
400 South Federal Hwy Hallandale Beach, FL 33009 
Work: 954-457-3023 Fax: 954-457-1342 
<tla mott@ ha I la nda lebeachfl .gov> 
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